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RESOLUTION NO. &-10-20

RESOLUTION ACCEPTING BIDS FOR THE PURCHASE OF
AGGREGATES, SAND, CONCRETE, AND ASPHALT CONCRETE
PRODUCTS FOR 2021

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE CITY
FORT SMITH, ARKANSAS, THAT:

The Bids, as indicated by enclosure on the attached Bid Tabulation
12-08-20BA for the purchase of concrete, asphalt, and other materials for 2021, are
accepted.

This Resolution adopted this l§‘£ day of December, 2020.

APPROVED:

e PAL

ATTEST:

T

CITY CLERK

Approved/as to form:
4 7%
v

# No Publication Required
o Publish Times




Tabulation of Bids for Concrete and Sand for 2021 (REVISED)
Bid Tab: 12-08-20BA
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APAC-Central, Inc. Mid-Continent Concrete Eagle Ready Mix River Valley Quarries 2020 Bid Prices
Ft. Smith, AR Ft. Smith, AR Van Buren, AR Fort Smith Bid Item #

Description At Plant Delivered At Plant Delivered At Plant Delivered At Plant Delivered AtPlant | Delivered
Crushed Stone (Aggregate Base) $12.00 (Vv N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A $10.50 |* N/A 2 $12.00 N/A
3/4" to 1 1/2" Concrete Rock $13.75 |V N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A $12.50 |* N/A 3 $13.75 N/A
Rip Rap $19.50 |V N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A $18.50 |* N/A 4 $19.50 N/A
Gabion Stone $19.50 |V N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A $12.00 |* N/A 5 $19.50 N/A
Concrete Class AAA/4000 PSI $86.00 $113.00 $85.00 |v/| $109.00 |v| $96.00 $110.00 No Bid No Bid 6a $83.00 | $106.00
Concrete Class AAA (AE)/4000 PSI $86.00 $113.00 $85.00 |v/| $109.00 |v| $96.00 $110.00 No Bid No Bid 6b $83.00 | $106.00
Concrete Class AAA (AE)(HES)/4000 PSI $107.00 $128.00 V| $105.50 |v| $129.00 $113.00 $127.00 No Bid No Bid 6¢ $104.00| $124.00
Concrete Class AA/3500 PSI $84.00 $110.00 $82.50 |v/| $106.00 |v| $92.00 $106.00 No Bid No Bid 6d $81.00 | $103.00
Concrete Class AA AE/3500 PSI $84.00 $110.00 V| $82.50 $106.00 |v| $92.00 $106.00 No Bid No Bid 6e $81.00 | $103.00
Concrete Class AA AE HES/3500 PSI $103.00 $125.00 V| $102.00 |Vv| $126.00 $110.00 $124.00 No Bid No Bid 6f $100.00| $121.00
Concrete Class A/3000 PSI $82.00 $108.00 $80.50 |v/| $104.00 |v| $88.00 $102.00 No Bid No Bid 6g $79.00 | $101.00
Concrete Class A (AE)/3000 PSI $82.00 $108.00 $80.50 |v/| $104.00 |v| $88.00 $102.00 No Bid No Bid 6h $79.00 | $101.00
Concrete Class A (AE)(HES)/3000 PSI $100.00 $122.00 $99.00 |V $121.00 |V/| $107.00 $121.00 No Bid No Bid 6i $97.00 | $117.00
Concrete Class B/2500 PSI $81.00 $105.00 $79.50 |Vv/| $104.00 |v| $88.00 $102.00 No Bid No Bid 6j $78.00 | $101.00
Concrete Class B (HES)/2500 PSI $99.00 |v/| $121.00 $100.00 $119.00 (V| $107.00 $121.00 No Bid No Bid 6k $96.00 | $117.00
Utility Backfill (Slurry) $70.00 $84.00 $69.00 $85.00 $63.00 |V| $77.00 |V| NoBid No Bid 7 $67.00 | $76.00
Sand $11.00 |V N/A N/A N/A No Bid No Bid $8.00 * N/A 8 $11.00 N/A
Stone Chips $19.50 |V N/A N/A N/A No Bid No Bid $18.25 | * N/A 12 $18.50 N/A
Optional Items
Calcium Chloride — 1% (Per Cubic Yard) N/A $3.00 N/A $3.00 |V N/A $3.00 N/A No Bid N/A $3.00 N/A
Calcium Chloride — 2% (Per Cubic Yard) N/A $6.00 N/A $6.00 |V N/A $6.00 N/A No Bid N/A $6.00 N/A
Fiber (Per Bag) N/A $6.00 N/A $6.00 |V N/A $6.00 N/A No Bid N/A $6.00 N/A
Hot Water N/A N/A N/A $5.00 |V N/A N/A N/A No Bid N/A $5.00 N/A

All Prices Firm for 2021

v Bid Award

* Plant is approx. 25 miles away, one way; APAC plant is approx. 9 miles away; does not meet local vendor preference criteria
APAC requested 5% Local Vendor Preference

GCC Mid-Continent requested 5% Local Vendor Preference
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Tabulation of Bids for Concrete and Sand for 2021
Bid Tab 12-08-20BA

Description

Asphalt Concrete Hot Mix Surface Course (ll)
Asphalt Concrete Cold Plant Mix
Asphalt Concrete High Performance Cold Mix
Asphaltic Concrete Hot Mix Binder Course
Asphaltic Concrete Hot Mix Surface Course
Asphaltic Concrete Hot Mix Surface Course-AHTD 12.5 mm
PG 64-22
PG 70-22
PG 76-22
Asphaltic Concrete Hot Mix Surface Course-AHTD 9.5 mm
PG 64-22
PG 70-22
PG 76-22

All Prices Firm for 2021
Vv Bid Award

"No bid" submitted by the following vendors:
GCC Mid-Continent

Eagle Ready Mix

River Valley Quarries
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APAC Central
Ft. Smith, AR
Bid 2020 Bid
At Plant Item # Prices
$73.00 |V 9 $73.00
NoBid |V 10 $105.00
$117.00 |V 11 N/A
$69.00 |V 13 $69.00
$73.00 |V 14 $73.00
$76.00 |V 15 $75.00
$84.00 |V 15 $84.00
$94.00 |V 15 $94.00
$79.00 |V 16 $79.00
$89.00 |V 16 $89.00
$94.00 |V 16 $94.00
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