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RESOLUTION NO. /3-H

RESOLUTION ACCEPTING BIDS FOR THE PURCHASE OF
FLEET TRUCKS AND VEHICLES

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE CITY
FORT SMITH, ARKANSAS, THAT:

The bids, as indicated by enclosure on the attached Bid Tabulation
07-18-14BA for the purchase of various trucks and vehicles for the City’s fleet, are
accepted.

This Resolution adopted this / ¢ - day of August, 2014.

APPROVED:

AYOR— T~

ATTEST:

/7 /élﬂ(/

CITY CLERK

Approved as to form:

X

No Publication Refuired
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Inter office Memorandum

TO: Ray Gosack, City Administrator The
| Clty .
FROM: Alie Bahsoon, Purchasing Manager P\% B
SUBJECT: 2014 Fleet Bid Tabulation
DATE:  August 13,2014 h
A R K A NSAS
BID TAB:  07-18-14BA

Bids were solicited for the purchase and replacement of numerous trucks and vehicles for various
departments within the City.

You will find attached the bid tabulation and the recommendations for bid award for each
respective department. I am also providing a recap of the fleet being replaced. Unless otherwise
noted, most will be sold at the annual city auction due to age, high mileage, and/or maintenance

1ssues:
®

Bid 1:
Bid 1:
Bid 1:

Customer Service-replace 2006 Ford F150 (Asset 951); new truck is CNG equipped
Engineering-replace 2003 Ford F150 (Asset 150)
Industrial Waster Monitoring-replace 2004 F150 (Asset 513)

Bid 1A: Water Stationary Equip. Maint.-replace 2002 Silverado LS1500 (Asset 422)

Bid 2:
Bid 4:
Bid 4:
Bid 6:
Bid 7:
Bid 7:
Bid 8:
Bid 9:
Bid 9:
Bid 9:

Bid 10:
Bid 10:
Bid 12:
Bid 13:
Bid 14:
Bid 15:
Bid 16:
Bid 16:

Transit-replace 1998 Crown Victoria (Asset 834); new vehicle is a hybrid
CDBG-replace 2002 Chevrolet Impala (Asset 149); new vehicle is a hybrid
Building Safety-replace 2011 Chevrolet Impala (Asset 126); new vehicle is a hybrid
Street Drainage-replace 2000 GMC dump truck (Asset 407)

Street Maintenance-replace 2002 Ford F350 (asset 471)

Sidewalk Construction-replace 1999 GMC Sierra 3500 (Asset 465)

Wastewater Equip. Maint.-replace 2006 Ford F250 (Asset 947)

Water Line Maint.-replace 2001 Ford F750 (Asset 158)

Sewer Line Maint.-replace 2000 International 4700 (Asset 459)

Sewer Line Construction-replace 2000 GMC Topkick (Asset 779)

Sewer Line Maint.-replace 2001 Chevrolet Silverado 3500 (Asset 488)

Sewer Line Construction-replace 2001 Chevrolet Silverado 3500 (Asset 487)
Metering/Transmission Line Maint.-replace 2006 Ford F350 (Asset 953)
Metering/Transmission Line Maint.-replace 2001 Dodge 2500 (Asset 482)

Water Line Maint.- replace three 2006 GMC Sierra 3500 (Asset 955/956/957)
Water Stationary Equip. Maint.-this is an addition to the fleet
Metering/Transmission Line Maint.-replace 2005 Chevrolet Trailblazer (Asset 40)
Metering/Transmission Line Maint.-replace 2005 Ford Explorer (Asset 750)

Bid 17: Residential Collection-replace 2009 Hybrid Ford Escape (Asset 33) currently
being used by the Purchasing and Finance Departments
Bid 18: Sanitation Administration-replace 2006 Ford Explorer (Asset 941) which will be
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transferred to the Planning & Zoning Division; Tahoe needed for power to pull box trailer
for trade shows and for ample cargo hauling and passenger capacity; I underestimated the
2014 budget which was not reflective of an 8 cylinder SUV which is what the department
needs in order to meet its needs

¢ Bid 18: Engineering-replace 2001 Jeep Cherokee (Asset 118)

Funds for these purchases are available and have been appropriated for in the 2014 Budget.

I am recommending that the Board accept and approve the bids as noted by enclosure on the
attached bid tabulation.

Please let me know if you should have any questions.



Interoffice Memorandum

The
TO: Ray Gosack, City Administrator 5(%)4/( Clty / ~
FROM: Greg Riley, Director of Street/Traffic C

SUBJECT: Dump Truck with Snow Plow Purchase m]&h

DATE: August 15, 2014 A RKANSAS

One of our ongoing service objectives is improve the efficiency of the snow removal program by
equipping trucks with snow plows. We currently have two older trucks that have been outfitted with
plows and carry older spreader equipment and two older trucks with spreader equipment. This was our
deployment to the streets in the past years snowfall which has been an improvement over previous years.
This year we have taken delivery of two new fully outfitted plow trucks with plows and spreaders that
will be a huge improvement over the existing trucks. They have larger plows and more sand carrying
capacity and will allow for pre-wetted application of sand/salt for quicker activation. These trucks were
part of the 2013 budget and are now ready to go.

The ultimate goal is to have four of these trucks and the third was part of the 2014 budget and bids have
been received for this truck. The fourth truck will be presented as part of the 2015 budget. These trucks
are also used for the day to day work that we do but are adaptable and designed to handle the snow
events.

This truck will be used in street drainage and replaces a 2000 model dump truck. Three bids were
received and Carco International’s bid of $126,487.24 was the low bid. Funds are available in the Street
Department sinking fund for this purchase.



Interoffice Memorandum The ﬁ

TO: Ray Gosack, City Administrator Clty _

FROM: Greg Riley, Director of Street/Traffic Cefitrol I i; r E

SUBJECT: One Ton Truck Purchase

DATE: August 15,2014 A RKANSAS

The 2014 budget include the purchase of two one ton flat-bed dump trucks. One for street maintenance
5304 and one for sidewalks 5305. These are replacing older trucks. A 1999 and a 2002 model.

Four bids were received and Dunn Ford’s bid of $38,797.32 was the low bid. Funds are available in the
Street Department sinking fund for this purchase.



CITY OF FORT SMITH
2014 FLEET BID TABULATION NO. 07-18-14BA

i Hreeden Dodge Dunn Ford Randall Ford Smith Chevrolet Lewis Ford Sales Sallisaw Ford Shipley Mator Carca Intl, Truck Cemers of AR
Ft. Smith, AR Sngler, OK F. Smnth, AR Fort Smith, AR Fayctieville, AR Sallisaw, OK Fort Smith, AR FL. Smith, AR Van Buren, AR
Yr: 2004 Yr: 2014
Make: RAM Make: Ford
Maodel: 1500 Madel: F150
Cost: $28767 v | Cost $19.42568 v
Del. 14-21 days Del. 45.60 duys
1 No Bid Mo Bud M Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid Mo Bl
Customer Service Utilitics (3610)
Budgeted: 529,000 | pudgeted: 525,000
With CNG
Enginocering
Budgeted: $21,800
Yr: 2014 ¥Yr: 2004
Muke: RAM Make: Ford
Model: 1500 Model: FI50
Cast: S23,186 Cost: 522, 155,68 v ) S 0 2 ) A
1A | pel 1421 days Dl 45-60 days No Bul No Bl No Bl No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bul
Utilities (3616)
Budgeted: $22,400
Y 2015 Y 2015 Ye: 2015
Make: Forld Make: Fonl Malke: Ford
Modcl: Fusion S Model: Fusion SE Model: Fusion S
Cost: 523,875.34 Cost: 524,392 Cost: 523,725 v
2 No Bid el 4560 days Del 60 vays No Bid No Bid Del. 601120 days No Bid No Bid Mo Bid

Hybrid

Transil
Builgeted: 24,700




CITY OF FORT SMITH
2014 FLEET BID TABULATION NO. 07-18-14BA

Bip | Bresten Dodge Dutin Ford Randall Ford Srith Chevralet | Lewis Ford Sales Sallisaw Ford Shipley Maotor Carco Inil. Truck Centers of AR
Fi. Smith, AR Stigler, OK Ft. Smith, AR Fort Smith, AR Fayetteville, AR Sallisaw, OK Faort Smith, AR FL Smith, AR Van Buren, AR
Yr: 2015 Yr: 2013 Yr: 2045
No Bad-Hybrid Make: Ford Muke: Ford No Bld-Hybrul Muke: Ford
Model: Fusion § Model: Fusion § Model: Fusion §
Cost: S23,875.34 Cosl; 524,392 Cost $23,725 v
Del. 45-60 duys Del. 60 days Del. 60-120 duys
4 No Bid LU No Bid Nu Bul No Bid
CDBG
Budgend: 528,900
Bildg. Safety
Hudgeted: 528 500
Yr: 2015 Yri 2005 Yr: 2005
Make: Mack Make: Iml. Muke: Freightliner
Madel: U432 Muodel: TA00SFA Model: 10850
Dump: Henderson Dump: Henderson Drump: Hendérson
. ) X ) Plow: Hendersan Plow: Henderson Plow: Hentlerson
6 WNo Bid No Bud Mo Bid No Bid WNo Bid o Bid Cost: $128.253.60 Cost: $126,457 24 ¥ | Cost: 130,364
Bel. 150 days Del, 120-150 days
Del. 150 duys Stroet Duinage
Budgered: $110,000
Yr 2015 Yr 20135 ¥r: 2015 ¥r: 2015
Make: RAM Make: Fond Make: Ford Make: Intl,
Model: 3500 Madcl: F350 Model: F350 Model: Termstar
Body: Cailet Body; Cadet Body: Cadet Body: Cudet
7 | Cost: 846,160 Cost: $38.797 32 v | Cost: 539,900 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Cost: S56,862.95 No Bid
Del. 175-200 days | Del. 45-60 days Del. 60-75 days Del. 150 diys

Street (S301/5304)
Budgeted: 40,000 en




CITY OF FORT SMITH
2014 FLEET BID TABULATION NO. 07-18-14BA

BiD Hreeden Dodge D Ford Randall Ford Sm:lll.(.'hn\'mlﬂ Lewis Ford Sales Sallisaw Ford Shipley Motor Curen Intl, Truck Centers of AR
Ft. Smith, AR Stigler, OK Fr. Smuth, AR Fort Smith, AR | Fagetteville, AR Sallisaw, OK Fort Smith, AR Fr. Smith, AR Van Buten, AR
Yr:2015 Y 2015 ¥Yr: 2015 Yr 2015 Yo 2015 Yr 2015
Make: RAM Make: Ford Make: Ford Make: Cheviolet Make: Ford Make: Ford
Maxdel: 2500 Model; F250 Muodcl: F250 Model: Silverado | Model: F250 Model: F250
Cosl: 527,382 Cost: $23,76564 v | Cost: 523,935 2500 Cost: 524,i89.02 | Copt: 522,975 * i "
8 | Del. 45-60 days Del. 45-60 days Del. 60 days Cost: $26,470 Del 90-120 days | Del. 60.90 days No Bl Na Bid NoBid
el 90 duys
Utilities (3606) *Does nol mect specs
Budgeted: $24,200
Peterbili of Fort Yr: 2015 Yr:2015 Yr 2015
Smith Make: HING Make: Intl. Make Freightliner
Model: 338 Model: 4300SFA Model: M2-100
¥ 2015 Dump: HilBil Dump: Davis Dump: Davis
Make: Peterbilt Mow: HilBilt Plow: Bavis Mlow: Davis
No Bi . : y Maodel; 337 Cost: 577915 Cost: 57091295 ¢ | Cost: 572,337
3 PRI ool b HeEk PEB Dump: Henderson | Del. 150 days Del, 100 days Pel. 90:120 days
Plow: Henderson
Cost: S76,081 Unilities
Del. 75-150 days (S610/5611/5612)
Budgeted: S80,000 ca
Yr: 2015 Y2015 Yr: 20138
Muke: RAM Make: Ford Make: Ford
Model: 3500 Model: F350 Model: F350
Body: Stahl Body: Knopheide 607 | Body: Suhl 607"
Cost; S48,024 Cost: S42,085 30 v | Cost S41.336 ¢
Del. 45-60 days Body: Knapheide 74" | Body: Stahl 74" i . .
10 cmfs‘-:z;xsk. ;’i‘: 7 costsataare No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Del, 45.60 days Del. 60 doys

Unitivies (561 1/5612)
Budgeted: $40,000 ca

*Docs not maeet specs




CITY OF FORT SMITH
2014 FLEET BID TABULATION NO. 07-18-14BA

BID ﬂﬂm!er} Dodge Dl_lrm Ford I_hmlnil Ford S_mll}r Chevrolet Lewis Ford Sales Sull{_mw Ford Shiptley Motor {flm_l Tnth Truck Cemters of AR
Fi. Smith, AR Stigler, OK Ft. Smith, ARt Fort Smith, AR Fayetteville, AR Sallizaw, QK Fort Suth, AR Ft, Smith, AR Van Buren, AR
Y2015 Yr: 2015 Yr: 2015
Make: RAM Make: Ford Make: Ford
Model: 3500 Model: F350 Muodel: F350
Body: Stahl Body: Stahl Body: Stahl
Cost: S48,682 Cost: $45,701.02 v | Cost: S45,411 *
12 | Del 60-75 days Body: Knaphee Del. 60 days No Bid No Bl No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cost: 54596830
Del, 45-60 days *Docs mol meet specs
Uilitios 5613
Budgeted: $56,000
Yr 2013 Y2015 Yr 2015
Make: RAM Make: Ford Muke: Ford
Model: 2500 Model: F250 Meodel: F250
Coat: 543,121 Body: Stahl Body: Stah)
Body: Stahl Cost: §36,784.02 Cost: SITHTS
13 | Del 60-75 duys Bady: Knapheide Body: Stahl No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cost: $37491,02 v | Del. 60 days
Del. 43-60 days
Unilities 5615
Budgeted: $42,000
¥Yr 2015 Y2015 ¥Yr 2015
Make: RAM Make: Ford Make: Ford
Model: 3500 Muodel: F350 Model: F350
Body: Stahl Body: Stahl Body: Stahl
Cost: §50,345 Cost; 543,72630 v | Cost: S43.675 *
1y, | DeLSo-a5aye Body: Kmpheide Dey 60 days No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid

Cost: 84539230
Del. 45:60 days

Utilities 5610
HBudgeted: S40,000 ca

*Docs nol mect spees




CITY OF FORT SMITH
2014 FLEET BID TABULATION NO. 07-18-14BA

BID Breeden Dodge Dunn Ford Randall Ford Smith Chevrolot Lewis Ford Sales Sallisaw Ford Shipley Moor Carco Intl, Truck Centers of AR
Fr. Smith, AR Stigler, OK Fr. Smith, AR Fort Snuth, AR Fuyetieville, AR Sullisuw, OK Fort Smith. AR Fr. Smith, AR Van Biren, AR
Yr: 2015 Yr: 2015 Yr 2015
Muke: RAM Make: Ford Make: Ford
Model: 2500 Model: F250 Model: F250
Body: Stahl Body: Knupheide Body: Stahl
15 | Cot=S4d 85 Cost: 3551542 v | Cost: $35.749 No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bil No Bid No i
Del. 60-75 days Del. 45-60 days Del. 60 duys
Utitities 3616
Budgeted: $40,000
Y2015
Make: Ford
Model: Transit CT
Cost: S23453 v _
1t No Bul No Bid Del. 60 days. No Bl No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Utilities 5613
Budgeted: $21,500 e
Yr: 2014 ¥r 2014 Yr 2015
Mako: RAM Make: Ford Make: Chevraler
Model: 15005T Model: F150 Model: Silverado
Cost: 527,568 ¥ Cost: $27,572.08 1500 . .
17 | pel. s days Del. 45-60 days No Bid Cost: 530316 No Bid No Bul No B No Bid No Bid
Del. 90 days
Sunitation 6302
Budgeted: $27,500
Yi: 2014 Yr 2015 ¥Yr: 2015 Yr 2015
Make: RAM SXT Make: Ford Make: Ford Maker Chevrolet
Model: Duranpo Maodel: Explorer Model: Explocer XLT Maodel: Tahoe
Cost: $31 862 Cost: $27.081,0) v | Cont: 530,564 Cost: 538927 v i .. o
18 Del. 10 days Del, 45-60 days Del, 45.60 days Del. 90 diys No Bid No Bid No B No Bid No Bid
Engincering Sunitution

Budgeted: S25,900

Budgeted: $28,900




CITY OF FORT SMITH
2014 FLEET BID TABULATION NO. 07-18-14BA

Bid | 172 Ton, Regular Cab, 4x2 Wheel Drive, V6 P/U Truek Bi-Fuel (CNG/Gasoling)  Qty. 1 (Customer Service)

Bid 1 1/2 Ton, Regular Cab, 4x2 Wheel Drive, V6 P/U Truck Qty. 2 (Engincering & Water Line Maintenance)

Bid 1A% Ton, Regular Cab, 4 Wheel Drive, V6 P/U Truck  Qty. | (Water Stationary Equipment Maintenance)

Bid2  4-Door Hybrid, Mid-Size Sedan per the latest edition of the EPA Fuel Economy Guide Qty. 1 (Public Transit)

Bid4  4-Door Hybrid, Full-Size Sedan per the latest edition of EPA Fuel Economy Guide  Qty. 2 (Community Development and Building Safety)
Bid6 Single Axle Cab & Chassis with 5 CY Dump Bed & Henderson Snow Plow  Qty. I (Street Drainage)

Bid 7 One (1) Ton 4x2 Single Cab Truck, Long Chassis, Dual Rear Wheels, Flat Dump Bed  Qty. 2 (Street Maintenance/Sidewalk Construetion)
Bid8  Three-Quarter (3/4) Tan Heavy Duty, 4x4 Pickup Truck, Long Bed  Qty. 1 (Wastewater Equipment Maintenance)

Bid9 2 Ton Single Axle Cab and Chassis Dump Truck  Qty. 3 (Water Line Maintenance/Sewer Line Mai [Sewer Line Con lion)
Bid 10 1 Ton Heavy Duty Cab and Chassis with Utility Service Body  Qty. 2 (Sewer Line Maintenance/ Sewer Line Construction)

Bid 12 | Ton Heavy Duty Cab and Chassis, 4x4, with Covered Utility Body  Qty. I (Metering/Transmission Line Maintenance)

Bid 13 % Ton Cab and Chassis, 4x4 with Utility Service Body  Qty. | (Water and Wastewater Line Maintenance Administration )

Bid 14 | Ton Heavy Duty Cab and Chassis with Covered Utility Body Qty. 3 (Walr.r me Mnmtcnunu.)

Bid 15 % Ton Cab and Chassis with Utility Service Body  Qty. | (Water Stationary I i §]

Bid 16 Gasoline/Electric Special Purpose 4 Door, LWB Passenger Wagon as defined i m thc US EPA Guide Qty. 2 ( Metering/Tr isston Line M
Bid |7 Standard Size 4x4 One-Half (1/2) Ton, Crew Cab, V8 PU Truck  Qty. I (Residential Collections)
Bid 18 Full-Size 4WD 7 or § passenger V8 Sports Utility Vehicle (SUV) as classified in the latest EPA Fuel Economy Guide Qty. 2 (Enginecring and S

¥ Recommended bid award



